
Design Principal Responsible Partner 
Answers will Vary 

Implementation Strategy 
  

Student learning is the focus:     
Clinical preparation is integrated 
throughout every facet of 
teacher education in a dynamic 
way: 

    

A candidate’s progress and the 
elements for preparation 
program continuously judged on 
the basis of data: 

    

Programs prepare teachers who 
are expert in content and how to 
teach it and are also innovators, 
collaborators and problem 
solvers: 

    

Candidates learn in an 
interactive professional 
community: 

    

Clinical educators and coaches 
are rigorously selected and 
prepared and drawn from both 
higher education and the P-12 
sector: 

    

Specific sites are designated 
and funded to support 
embedded clinical preparation  

    

Technology applications foster 
high-impact preparation 

    

A powerful research and 
development agenda and 
systematic gathering and use of 
data supports continuous 
improvement in teacher 
preparation 

    

Strategic partnerships are 
imperative for powerful clinical 
preparation: 

    

 


	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryStudent learning is the focus: 
	Implementation StrategyStudent learning is the focus: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryClinical preparation is integrated throughout every facet of teacher education in a dynamic way: 
	Implementation StrategyClinical preparation is integrated throughout every facet of teacher education in a dynamic way: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryA candidates progress and the elements for preparation program continuously judged on the basis of data: 
	Implementation StrategyA candidates progress and the elements for preparation program continuously judged on the basis of data: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryPrograms prepare teachers who are expert in content and how to teach it and are also innovators collaborators and problem solvers: 
	Implementation StrategyPrograms prepare teachers who are expert in content and how to teach it and are also innovators collaborators and problem solvers: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryCandidates learn in an interactive professional community: 
	Implementation StrategyCandidates learn in an interactive professional community: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryClinical educators and coaches are rigorously selected and prepared and drawn from both higher education and the P12 sector: 
	Implementation StrategyClinical educators and coaches are rigorously selected and prepared and drawn from both higher education and the P12 sector: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VarySpecific sites are designated and funded to support embedded clinical preparation: 
	Implementation StrategySpecific sites are designated and funded to support embedded clinical preparation: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryTechnology applications foster highimpact preparation: 
	Implementation StrategyTechnology applications foster highimpact preparation: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryA powerful research and development agenda and systematic gathering and use of data supports continuous improvement in teacher preparation: 
	Implementation StrategyA powerful research and development agenda and systematic gathering and use of data supports continuous improvement in teacher preparation: 
	Responsible Partner Answers will VaryStrategic partnerships are imperative for powerful clinical preparation: 
	Implementation StrategyStrategic partnerships are imperative for powerful clinical preparation: 


